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Sisters Gracie and Juliette Bennett, once the best of friends, have grown apart over the years, each following
her own life's path. But with the passing of their beloved grandmother Mimi their paths intertwine in the
most unexpected and peculiar way.

Gracie and Juliette are set to inherit Mimi's house--the charming Santa Barbara Craftsman, a family heirloom
three generations old. But there's a catch. In order to inherit their home away from home the sisters must live
at 1402 Laguna Lane for one year...together.

Now under one roof, Gracie and Juliette have a chance to reexamine their relationship and confront their
pasts. Over the course of the trying year ahead they will learn that Mimi's clever plan is about more than
preserving a piece of family history.

But will they overcome their differences, perhaps even become the kinds of friends only sisters can be?
Loyalties will be tested and secrets revealed. And in their darkest hours Gracie and Juliette will have to
decide if a sister's love is what they need to get through the year. If a unique friendship between sisters is
what they've needed all along.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Kline:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you should have this A Sister's Place.

Ashley McKay:

The guide with title A Sister's Place has lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of
profit after read this book. This particular book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the
e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Antione Wilson:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you possess when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you have read
is actually A Sister's Place.

Benjamin Martinez:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this guide. This A Sister's Place is simple to bring you
can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the particular
book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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