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Internationally known management consultants Nicholas Imparato and Oren Harari connect the big picture
of our changing civilizations with the specific practical actions that managers have to take to produce results
today. All organizations are faced with the same challenge: the need to jump the curve to make significant,
discontinuous leaps in their thinking, whether about product, technology, or management style. The
alternative to follow current practices all the way to their inevitable decline is unacceptable. The authors
show us that it is also unnecessary.

Drawing on numerous personal interviews with innovative leaders around the world, as well as research and
first-hand observation, Imparato and Harari identify the four strategic imperatives--innovation, intelligence,
coherence, and responsibility--that will enable companies to successfully jump the curve and thrive in the
emerging epoch. And they show how cutting-edge companies and leaders are translating these imperatives
into action.

Not since the dawn of the Modern Age some five hundred years ago has civilization undergone the kind of
profound, rapid-fire changes we're experiencing today. Even organizations that are adapting, growing and
innovating have the gnawing sense that obsolescence is right around the corner. Jumping the Curve offers
perspective and guidance for doing business at this unique moment in time. It connects the big picture of our
changing world with the practical actions managers must take now to position their organizations for success
in a new epoch we can't yet fully see or understand.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan McLean:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Jumping the
Curve: Innovation and Strategic Choice in an Age of Transition? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
realize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree
with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Henrietta Roderick:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the title Jumping the Curve:
Innovation and Strategic Choice in an Age of Transition suitable to you? The particular book was written by
famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled Jumping the Curve: Innovation and Strategic Choice in
an Age of Transitionis a single of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired many
men and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new way of measuring that you
ever know ahead of. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to
know the core of this publication. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So that
you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Clifford Caldwell:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Jumping the Curve:
Innovation and Strategic Choice in an Age of Transition which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this
book? Let's find.

Angie Blakney:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is referred to as of book
Jumping the Curve: Innovation and Strategic Choice in an Age of Transition. You can contribute your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to
read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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