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Want to ditch the drama and thrive through your twenties?

Body image. Friendships. Career. Money. Dating. All these issues and more serve as points of stress for the
20-something woman, and combined they can make for a decade of drama in a girl's life. Sarah Francis
Martin is the slightly older girlfriend who’s been there, done that, and got the not-so-cute t-shirt. Through
this interactive Bible study, Sarah helps young adult women address each stress point by encouraging them
to wait on the Lord, worship Him, and make Him the focus of their lives.

In Stress Point you will:

Find interactive chapters covering ten stress points for the 20-something woman●

Dig through Scripture to apply truth to each stress point●

Engage with real, raw, and relevant stories from girlfriends just like you●

Journal through each chapter to engage with God in a meaningful way●

Interact with Sarah through her video blogs for each chapter●

Connect with your girlfriends in a Stress Point Survival Group; leader guide included●

Sarah Francis Martin has a passion to encourage and relate to women in their twenties, and is honored to do
so through She Seeks, the 20-something ministry of Proverbs 31. Her relevant and conversational style will
lead young adult readers to live out the Kingship of Christ in everyday life in order to find godly success,
purpose, and well-being. Obsessed with pink lip gloss and all things artsy-crafty, Sarah lives with her
husband and son in North Carolina. Her ministry, LIVE IT OUT!, is a space for 20-somethings to connect
with one another and grow closer to Jesus (www.liveitoutblog.com).
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From reader reviews:

Adriana Phillips:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Stress Point: Thriving Through
Your Twenties in a Decade of Drama. All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the
internet resources or other social media.

Susan Belcher:

Here thing why this particular Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a Decade of Drama are
different and trusted to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content
from it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a
Decade of Drama giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out
there but there is no book that similar with Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a Decade of
Drama. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing that
happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing
the published book maybe the form of Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a Decade of Drama
in e-book can be your option.

Billie Brown:

The book with title Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a Decade of Drama has lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new
understanding the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside
new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Matthew Seifert:

The book untitled Stress Point: Thriving Through Your Twenties in a Decade of Drama contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains her idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the
people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read this. The book was authored by famous author. The
author will take you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read on
your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish
to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice examine.
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