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For anyone who has ever wondered about the mysteries that lie beyond everyday experience, or doubted the
reality of the afterlife, Angels in My Hair  is a moving and deeply inspirational journey into the unseen
world.

For as long as she can remember, Lorna Byrne has seen angels. As a young child, she assumed everyone
could see the otherworldly beings who always accompanied her. Yet in the eyes of adults, her abnormal
behavior was a symptom of mental deficiency. Today, sick and troubled people from around the world are
drawn to her for comfort and healing, and even theologians of different faiths seek her guidance. Lorna is
trusted for her ability to communicate with spirits and angels—and by sharing her intimate knowledge of the
spiritual world she offers a message of hope and love to us all.

Angels in My Hair is an engrossing chronicle of Lorna’s incredible life story. Invoking a wonderful sense of
place, she describes growing up poor in Ireland, finding work in Dublin, and marrying the man of her
dreams—only to have the marriage cut short by tragedy. Already a bestseller in Ireland, her story gives
readers a unique insight into the angelic help that is around us and available to us all the time. As Lorna says,
"All you have to do is ask."

In this uplifting autobiography, a modern-day Irish mystic shares her vivid encounters and conversations
with the angels and spirits she has known her entire life.
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From reader reviews:

Shannon Grant:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you imagine the story how
the figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Angels
in My Hair, you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire
others, make them reading a e-book.

Henry Hedrick:

Often the book Angels in My Hair has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get
a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research before
write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Jason Valladares:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying Angels in My Hair that give
your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be
said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react toward the world. It
can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to
be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you are able to pick
Angels in My Hair become your current starter.

Thomas Smith:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what
sorts of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon.
The Angels in My Hair will give you new experience in reading through a book.
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