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Ikhwan al-Safa' (The Brethren of Purity) were the anonymous adepts of a tenth-century esoteric fraternity of
lettered urbanites that was principally based in Basra and Baghdad. This brotherhood occupied a prominent
station in the history of science and philosophy in Islam due to the wide reception and assimilation of their
monumental encyclopedia: Rasa'il Ikhwan al-Safa' (The Epistles of the Brethren of Purity). This
compendium contained fifty-two epistles that offered synoptic explications of the classical sciences and
philosophies of the age. Divided into four classificatory parts, it treated themes in mathematics, logic, natural
philosophy, psychology, metaphysics and theology, in addition to moral and didactic fables. The Ikhwan
were learned compilers of scientific and philosophical knowledge, and their Rasa'il constituted a
paradigmatic legacy in the canonization of philosophy and the sciences in mediaeval Islamic civilization.

This present volume gathers studies by leading philosophers, historians and scholars of Islamic Studies, who
are also the editors and translators of the first Arabic critical editions and first complete annotated English
translations of the Rasa'il Ikhwan al-Safa', which will be published in the OUP Series that this present
volume initiates, as well as being members of the Editorial Board.

The chapters of this present volume explore the conceptual and historical aspects of the philosophical and
scientific contents of the Rasa'il and their classification, as well as investigating the authorship and dating of
this corpus and the impact that the Ikhwan's intellectual tradition exercised in the unfolding of the history of
ideas in Islam.
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From reader reviews:

Leticia Nielson:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen within you if you take The Ikhwan al-Safa and their Rasa'il:
An Introduction (Epistles of the Brethren of Purity) as your daily resource information.

Vanessa McGinty:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the whole
day to reading a reserve. The book The Ikhwan al-Safa and their Rasa'il: An Introduction (Epistles of the
Brethren of Purity) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book.
We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book
you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not
too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Siobhan Wilcox:

As a student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or real
their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this The Ikhwan al-Safa and their Rasa'il: An Introduction (Epistles of the Brethren of
Purity) can make you truly feel more interested to read.

Sheri Williams:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt this when they get
a half portions of the book. You can choose the book The Ikhwan al-Safa and their Rasa'il: An Introduction
(Epistles of the Brethren of Purity) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading
talent is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a



book and examine it. Beside that the book The Ikhwan al-Safa and their Rasa'il: An Introduction (Epistles of
the Brethren of Purity) can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of that time.
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