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Privacy: A Short History provides a vital historical account of an increasingly stressed sphere of human
interaction. At a time when the death of privacy is widely proclaimed, distinguished historian, David
Vincent, describes the evolution of the concept and practice of privacy from the Middle Ages to the present
controversy over digital communication and state surveillance provoked by the revelations of Edward
Snowden.

Deploying a range of vivid primary material, he discusses the management of private information in the
context of housing, outdoor spaces, religious observance, reading, diaries and autobiographies,
correspondence, neighbours, gossip, surveillance, the public sphere and the state. Key developments, such as
the nineteenth-century celebration of the enclosed and intimate middle-class household, are placed in the
context of long-term development. The book surveys and challenges the main currents in the extensive
secondary literature on the subject. It seeks to strike a new balance between the built environment and world
beyond the threshold, between written and face-to-face communication, between anonymity and familiarity
in towns and cities, between religion and secular meditation, between the state and the private sphere and,
above all, between intimacy and individualism.

Ranging from the fourteenth century to the twenty-first, this book shows that the history of privacy has been
an arena of contested choices, and not simply a progression towards a settled ideal. Privacy: A Short History
will be of interest to students and scholars of history, and all those interested in this topical subject.
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Marine:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book called Privacy: A Short
History? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some other
opinion?

Robbie Stamant:

The book untitled Privacy: A Short History contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains her idea
with easy technique. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to
read that. The book was published by famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary
works. You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the
book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site along
with order it. Have a nice read.

Bonnie Skelton:

This Privacy: A Short History is brand-new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some
information given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this Privacy: A Short History can be the light food in
your case because the information inside this specific book is easy to get through anyone. These books
produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book form. People who think that
in e-book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a
guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't
miss it! Just read this e-book style for your better life along with knowledge.

Glen Hall:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many books in
the top listing in your reading list is usually Privacy: A Short History. This book which can be qualified as
The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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