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An examination of the failure of the United States as a broker in the Palestinian-Israeli peace process,
through three key historical moments
 
For more than seven decades the conflict between Israel and the Palestinian people has raged on with no end
in sight, and for much of that time, the United States has been involved as a mediator in the conflict. In this
book, acclaimed historian Rashid Khalidi zeroes in on the United States’s role as the purported impartial
broker in this failed peace process.

Khalidi closely analyzes three historical moments that illuminate how the United States’ involvement has, in
fact, thwarted progress toward peace between Israel and Palestine. The first moment he investigates is the
“Reagan Plan” of 1982, when Israeli prime minister Menachem Begin refused to accept the Reagan
administration’s proposal to reframe the Camp David Accords more impartially. The second moment covers
the period after the Madrid Peace Conference, from 1991 to 1993, during which negotiations between Israel
and Palestine were brokered by the United States until the signing of the secretly negotiated Oslo accords.
Finally, Khalidi takes on President Barack Obama’s retreat from plans to insist on halting the settlements in
the West Bank.

Through in-depth research into and keen analysis of these three moments, as well as his own firsthand
experience as an advisor to the Palestinian delegation at the 1991 pre–Oslo negotiations in Washington, DC,
Khalidi reveals how the United States and Israel have actively colluded to prevent a Palestinian state and
resolve the situation in Israel’s favor. Brokers of Deceit bares the truth about why peace in the Middle East
has been impossible to achieve: for decades, US policymakers have masqueraded as unbiased agents
working to bring the two sides together, when, in fact, they have been the agents of continuing injustice,
effectively preventing the difficult but essential steps needed to achieve peace in the region.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Elinor Russell:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in
the Middle East. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important a new book Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in the Middle East. You can
add expertise and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, mainly because
from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library.
Let's study.

Edward Olivieri:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys that
aren't like that. This Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in the Middle East book is
readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
examining experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer
connected with Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in the Middle East content conveys
prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content
but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has
Undermined Peace in the Middle East is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Todd McCrea:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole day to reading a
reserve. The book Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in the Middle East it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this
book. If you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can
m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high
quality.

Judith Bradshaw:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Brokers of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in
the Middle East was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Brokers
of Deceit: How the U.S. Has Undermined Peace in the Middle East has many kinds or genre. Start from kids
until teens. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you are the



character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel
happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading in which.
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