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Monsieur Perdu can prescribe the perfect book for a broken heart. But can he fix his own?
 
Monsieur Perdu calls himself a literary apothecary. From his floating bookstore in a barge on the Seine, he
prescribes novels for the hardships of life. Using his intuitive feel for the exact book a reader needs, Perdu
mends broken hearts and souls. The only person he can't seem to heal through literature is himself; he's still
haunted by heartbreak after his great love disappeared. She left him with only a letter, which he has never
opened.

After Perdu is finally tempted to read the letter, he hauls anchor and departs on a mission to the south of
France, hoping to make peace with his loss and discover the end of the story. Joined by a bestselling but
blocked author and a lovelorn Italian chef, Perdu travels along the country’s rivers, dispensing his wisdom
and his books, showing that the literary world can take the human soul on a journey to heal itself.

Internationally bestselling and filled with warmth and adventure, The Little Paris Bookshop is a love letter to
books, meant for anyone who believes in the power of stories to shape people's lives.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Frye:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for us. The book The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel seemed to be making you to know
about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for
you. The publication The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel is not only giving you much more new information
but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book.
Try to make relationship using the book The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel. You never sense lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Camille Wolfe:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel can be
the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Linda Harris:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This particular The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel can give you a
lot of good friends because by you investigating this one book you have issue that they don't and make a
person more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This
book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than additional
make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel.

Ashley Robinette:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. By the book The Little Paris Bookshop: A Novel we can consider more advantage. Don't someone
to be creative people? Being creative person must like to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book The Little Paris
Bookshop: A Novel. You can more pleasing than now.
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