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BRS Embryology, Fourth Edition is a succinct outline-format review for USMLE and course exams, with
USMLE-style questions at the end of each chapter and a comprehensive USMLE-style examination at the
end of the book. The book also includes radiographs, sonograms, computed tomography scans, and
photographs of various congenital malformations.

This updated edition has a new organization: prefertilization through the embryonic period; system by
system; genetic abnormalities; and teratology. The chapter on structural chromosomal abnormalities has been
substantially revised. This edition's review questions are in the clinical vignette-based format of the current
USMLE.

A companion Website offers the fully searchable online text and an interactive question bank.
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From reader reviews:

Nicolas Jones:

Typically the book BRS Embryology (Board Review Series) has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to
read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after looking over this book.

Jeanne Newman:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside search likes.
Maybe you answer may be BRS Embryology (Board Review Series) why because the excellent cover that
make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic
as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Harvey Sanchez:

The book untitled BRS Embryology (Board Review Series) contain a lot of information on the idea. The
writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published by famous author. The author will take
you in the new era of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can keep reading your smart
phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you
can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Ann Ginsberg:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source which filled update of news. On
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the BRS Embryology (Board Review Series) when you essential it?
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