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If you lie awake worrying about the overnight transition from December 31, 1 b.c., to January 1, a.d. 1 (there
is no year zero), then you will enjoy Duncan Steel's Marking Time.--American Scientist

""No book could serve as a better guide to the cumulative invention that defines the imaginary threshold to
the new millennium.""--Booklist

A Fascinating March through History and the Evolution of the Modern-Day Calendar . . .

In this vivid, fast-moving narrative, you'll discover the surprising story of how our modern calendar came
about and how it has changed dramatically through the years. Acclaimed author Duncan Steel explores each
major step in creating the current calendar along with the many different systems for defining the number of
days in a week, the length of a month, and the number of days in a year. From the definition of the lunar
month by Meton of Athens in 432 b.c. to the roles played by Julius Caesar, William the Conqueror, and Isaac
Newton to present-day proposals to reform our calendar, this entertaining read also presents ""timely""
tidbits that will take you across the full span of recorded history. Find out how and why comets have been
used as clocks, why there is no year zero between 1 b.c. and a.d. 1, and why for centuries Britain and its
colonies rang in the New Year on March 25th. Marking Time will leave you with a sense of awe at the
haphazard nature of our calendar's development. Once you've read this eye-opening book, you'll never look
at the calendar the same way again.
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From reader reviews:

Hallie Cathey:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to a person is
you don't know what one you should start with. This Marking Time: The Epic Quest to Invent the Perfect
Calendar is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want
and want in this era.

Lisa Cook:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone at everywhere. The
information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider whenever those
information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking seriously which
one is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Marking Time: The Epic Quest to Invent the Perfect
Calendar as your daily resource information.

Amy Mueller:

The book untitled Marking Time: The Epic Quest to Invent the Perfect Calendar contain a lot of information
on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy means. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by
famous author. The author gives you in the new period of time of literary works. You can easily read this
book because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition
to order it. Have a nice learn.

Patty Scheuerman:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Marking Time: The Epic Quest to Invent
the Perfect Calendar is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you
did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier
to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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