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Contesting Security investigates to what extent the ‘logic of security’, which underpins securitization, can be
contained, rolled back or dismantled.

Featuring legitimacy as a cement of security practices, this volume presents a detailed account of the "logic"
which sustains security in order to develop a novel approach to the relation between security and the policies
in which it is engraved. Understanding security as a normative practice, the contributors suggest a nuanced,
and richer take on the conditions under which it is possible, advisable or fair to accept or roll back its
policies.

The book comprises four sections, each investigating one specific modality of contesting security practices:
resistance, desecuritization, emancipation, and resilience. These strategies are examined, compared and
assessed in different political and cultural habitats.

This book will be of much interest to students of critical security studies, securitisation theory, social theory,
and IR in general.
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From reader reviews:

Randall Blake:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV,
or perhaps playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole
day to reading a guide. The book Contesting Security: Strategies and Logics (PRIO New Security Studies) it
is extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading
this book. In case you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You
can m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book provides
high quality.

Keri Yokum:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get large amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time,
we will say absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
are you experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book
you have read will be Contesting Security: Strategies and Logics (PRIO New Security Studies).

Doreen Williams:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Contesting Security:
Strategies and Logics (PRIO New Security Studies), you are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination
right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys.
What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Margaret Padua:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top checklist in your reading list is usually Contesting Security: Strategies and Logics (PRIO New Security
Studies). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be
precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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