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The Tomorrow Series in this contemporary romance from author Cyndi Raye

Maybe a little distraction is exactly what she needs.......

With a deadline looming and writer's block hampering her efforts, Maggie McCoy, Best Selling Romance
Writer, jets to the Florida Keys for a much needed getaway and inspiration.

Her plans to be alone die the moment she meets Jake Hatfield. She needs to clear her head and get her book
written so her fans don't abandon her, but he soon proves too much of a distraction for serious-minded
Maggie. Soon she finds herself immersed in a lifestyle like those of her novel's heroines. From motorcycle
rides to a full-moon party and kissing under the stars, its all Maggie can do to keep herself focused.

Falling for a sexy man was never a part of the plan, but in him she finds that there's room in her life for more
than she could have ever imagined. Never having planned to fall in love in paradise, what is Maggie to do?

Action, Adventure and a little bit of suspense are all elements in this 3 part serial. Will their love survive and
last threw each stormy sea?

Contemporary Romance Novella Boxed Set

Cyndi Raye books are about the adventures in a place where romance, love, mystery, adventure and moonlit
nights run rampant. Filled with romance and a little mystery and sometimes spies, you'll find some of the
characters in other books through all the series.

Other books by Cyndi

Forever Series



Nothing Waits Forever #1 (FREE)

Nothing Lasts Forever #2

Promise Me Forever #3

Forever Boxed Set

Escape Series

Key West Wild #1 (FREE)

Key West Fierce #1

Key West On Fire #3

Escape Boxed Set

No Name Inn Short Stories
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From reader reviews:

Jake Leslie:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed Set (Contemporary Romance). Try to
make the book Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed Set (Contemporary Romance) as your good friend. It
means that it can being your friend when you sense alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every
thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Eric Bass:

The particular book Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed Set (Contemporary Romance) will bring one to the
new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you
try to find new book you just read, this book very ideal to you. The book Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed
Set (Contemporary Romance) is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

William Painter:

You may spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed Set
(Contemporary Romance) is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and soon. If you
did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.

Peter Zimmerman:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source in which filled
update of news. With this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just searching for the Tomorrow Series: Complete Boxed Set (Contemporary Romance) when you essential
it?
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