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At a long-forgotten battle in German Cameroon in 1915 Africa, the fates of two families became forever
entwined. Decades later, one remaining son, Paul Hoffman, must unravel their twisted destinies. Valhalla
Revealed, the riveting sequel to Robert A. Wright’s debut thriller Beyond Ultra, is a mesmerizing family
saga that navigates conflicted loyalties, a languishing colonial era, and the shadow of the Cold War. Can one
fixated man finally cast light on the irrepressible curse of Valhalla?

An immigrant to America from Spanish Guinea in Africa, Paul simply cannot look forward until he finally
makes sense of the past. Above all, he must find his brother Hans, a German U-boat captain who vanished a
month before World War II ended. When Paul starts to mine long-suppressed events, he soon finds that no
one is quite who they appear to be. Eventually, all is revealed about the clandestine mission in Africa known
as Operation Valhalla as Paul finally makes the connections. As he faces CIA operatives and Cold War
tactics, Paul must reckon with the sins of his own family.

With searing action, subtle characters, and intense family drama, Valhalla Revealed will transfix anyone
fascinated by history and those who forged it.
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From reader reviews:

Clarence Nelson:

The e-book untitled Valhalla Revealed is the reserve that recommended to you to read. You can see the
quality of the book content that will be shown to you. The language that article author use to explained their
way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of investigation when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book
of Valhalla Revealed from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Eric Baur:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Valhalla Revealed that give
your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be
said as the opportinity for people to know world a great deal better then how they react toward the world. It
can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for all of you who
wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you
are able to pick Valhalla Revealed become your own starter.

Kelli Smith:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Valhalla Revealed will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Joe Williams:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but novel and Valhalla Revealed or even others sources were given
expertise for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science
reserve was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to add their
knowledge. In various other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Valhalla Revealed to make
your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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