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This masterly account of Leonardo da Vinci and his vision of the world has long been recognized as the
classic treatment of the Renaissance giant, offering unparalleled insight into Leonardo's intellect and vision
at every stage of his artistic career.
Martin Kemp, one of the world's leading authorities on Leonardo, takes us on a mesmerizing journey through
the whole span of the great man's life, painting a fully integrated picture of his artistic, scientific, and
technological achievements. Kemp shows how Leonardo's early training in Florence provided a crucial
foundation in the "science of art," particularly perspective and anatomy, while his period in the service of the
Sforzas of Milan enlarged his outlook to embrace a wide range of natural sciences and mathematics, as he
searched for scientific rules governing both man and the universe. It was these rules, Kemp argues, which
provided the basis for his imaginative reconstruction of nature in masterworks such as the Last Supper, The
Mona Lisa, and St. John, which reveal his increasingly complex vision of man in the context of nature. And
towards the end of his life, Leonardo became fascinated with the mathematics underlying the "design of
nature," behind which lay the ultimate force of the "prime mover," as manifested with supreme power in his
Deluge drawings.
Covering every aspect of Leonardo's achievement, generously illustrated, and now including a new
introductory chapter setting Leonardo's work in its historical context, this fully updated edition provides
unparalleled insight into the mind of this central figure in western art.

"Sensitive and original descriptions of the master's paintings... combining the achievements of Kenneth
Clark's classic on the artist with V. P. Zubov's unsurpassed account of the scientist in the context of his age."
--E. H. Gombritch, The Times Literary Supplement (on the first edition)
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From reader reviews:

Armando Rodgers:

Typically the book Leonardo da Vinci: The Marvellous Works of Nature and Man has a lot details on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
This articles author makes some research ahead of write this book. This specific book very easy to read you
can get the point easily after perusing this book.

Lou Whisenhunt:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. Among the books
in the top list in your reading list is usually Leonardo da Vinci: The Marvellous Works of Nature and Man.
This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By
looking upwards and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Joan Freeman:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year was exactly added. This reserve Leonardo da Vinci: The Marvellous Works of Nature and Man was
filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading any book. If you know how big good thing
about a book, you can experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get
book that you just wanted.

Jay Klein:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that query was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is Leonardo da Vinci: The
Marvellous Works of Nature and Man.
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