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THAT WAS THEN - THIS IS NOW - No matter what your past has been, your story is not over. Your story
may have chapters filled with heartaches and happiness, rain and sunshine, villains and heroes, thrilling
triumphs and agonizing defeats, but it is not over. Your past is a part of your story, but it is not the whole.
Your story is still emerging and unfolding, even now. In the same way that you cannot read the next chapter
of a book without some reference to the previous chapter: your past will always be with you. No matter how
discomforting that thought may be, it bears the melodic ring of truth. Your past has shaped you, but also
been shaped by you. It is yours with all of its grief and glory.

You can attempt to ignore your past, but it remains present. You can try to discard your past, but it continues
to post itself on your daily agenda. You can try to mute the voice of the past, but even strained, it continues
to shout. Your past is always with you because it is part of your story. Sometimes the past is a vibrant source
of power while at other times; it is a source of throbbing pain. Sometimes the past is a dynamic catalyst
while at other times; it is an inhospitable harness. The past is not dead or inactive; it is contemporary and
close, as close as one chapter in a story is to the next.

The purpose of this book is to encourage you to acknowledge and then transform your past. Your past can be
a source of power, rather than just pain; a platform for healing, rather than just continued hurt. You can turn
the page. I am convinced that whatever you have experienced in the chapters of your past, there is something
miraculous, amazing and incredible awaiting you in the chapters of your future. That Was Then - This is
Now!
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Valles:

Within other case, little folks like to read book That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a
book That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past. You can add know-how and of course
you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can understand
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It
is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Marissa Wegener:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past book is
readable by simply you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable reading experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you.
The writer of That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past content conveys the idea easily to
understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different such
as it. So , do you still thinking That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past is not loveable
to be your top collection reading book?

Ruth Westlund:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the entire day
to reading a publication. The book That Was Then - This Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past it is quite
good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading
this book. In case you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can
m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book features
high quality.

Dianne Roy:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby.
So you know that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something



by book. Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is That Was Then - This
Is Now: Properly Packaging Your Past.
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