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Following the success of the landmark bestsellers First, Break All the Rules and Now, Discover Your
Strengths, Marcus Buckingham offers a dramatically new way to understand the art of success.

With over 1.6 million copies of First, Break All the Rules (co-authored with Curt Coffman) and Now,
Discover Your Strengths (co-authored with Donald O. Clifton) in print, Cambridge-educated Buckingham is
considered one of the most respected business authorities on the subject of management and leadership in the
world. With The One Thing You Need to Know, he gives readers an invaluable course in outstanding
achievement -- a guide to capturing the essence of the three most fundamental areas of professional activity.

Great managing, leading, and career success -- Buckingham draws on a wealth of applicable examples to
reveal that a controlling insight lies at the heart of the three. Lose sight of this "one thing" and even the best
efforts will be diminished or compromised. Readers will be eager to discover the surprisingly different
answers to each of these rich and complex subjects. Each could be explained endlessly to detail their many
facets, but Buckingham's great gift is his ability to cut through the mass of often-conflicting agendas and
zero in on what matters most, without ever oversimplifying. As he observes, success comes to those who
remain mindful of the core insight, understand all of its ramifications, and orient their decisions around it.
Buckingham backs his arguments with authoritative research from a wide variety of sources, including his
own research data and in-depth interviews with individuals at every level of an organization, from CEO's to
hotel maids and stockboys.

In every way a groundbreaking book, The One Thing You Need to Know offers crucial performance and
career lessons for business people at all career stages.
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From reader reviews:

Alice Hill:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of The One
Thing You Need to Know: ... About Great Managing, Great Leading, and Sustained Individual Success book
as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Timothy McKinney:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet
and the resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How
many people to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a
book. Looking at a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this The
One Thing You Need to Know: ... About Great Managing, Great Leading, and Sustained Individual Success
book as this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred %
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Virginia Mack:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept The One Thing
You Need to Know: ... About Great Managing, Great Leading, and Sustained Individual Success suitable to
you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book untitled The One Thing You Need to
Know: ... About Great Managing, Great Leading, and Sustained Individual Successis a single of several
books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read
this publication you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know previous to. The author explained
their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to know the core of this reserve. This book
will give you a great deal of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world
in this book.

Catherine Hudson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their leisure
activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach



Chinese's country. Therefore this The One Thing You Need to Know: ... About Great Managing, Great
Leading, and Sustained Individual Success can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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