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Since the end of the Cold War, scholars and analysts have been predicting the collapse of the communist
regime in North Korea. Yet, despite a deteriorating economy characterized by declining industrial output,
outdated technology, and difficulty feeding its people, the country has been able to persist and continues to
plod along. How has North Korea been able to survive, and how long can it last without significant change to
its economic and political structures? How can we peacefully resolve the North Korean nuclear standoff
through constructive dialogue?

This book examines North Korea's survival strategy and offers practical solutions to a 50-year nuclear
standoff through a series of essays written by 15 of the world's foremost scholars and leading experts on
strategy, economics and international relations. It is essential reading for anyone interested in peace in
Northeast Asia and will be invaluable in helping policy-makers, diplomats, politicians, researchers and other
North Korea watchers to understand three closely related issues about North Korea: (1) why North Korea
will continue to survive; (2) how the United States and North Korea can build a mutual confidence; and (3)
why a dialogue is the only viable way to resolve the North Korea problem peacefully.
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From reader reviews:

Doris McNeal:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this The Survival of North Korea: Essays on Strategy, Economics and
International Relations.

Todd Jacob:

Here thing why this The Survival of North Korea: Essays on Strategy, Economics and International
Relations are different and trusted to be yours. First of all examining a book is good however it depends in
the content from it which is the content is as delightful as food or not. The Survival of North Korea: Essays
on Strategy, Economics and International Relations giving you information deeper and different ways, you
can find any book out there but there is no book that similar with The Survival of North Korea: Essays on
Strategy, Economics and International Relations. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your
personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You
can actually bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by train. In case you are
having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of The Survival of North Korea: Essays on
Strategy, Economics and International Relations in e-book can be your alternative.

Keith Barnett:

This The Survival of North Korea: Essays on Strategy, Economics and International Relations are reliable
for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Survival of North
Korea: Essays on Strategy, Economics and International Relations can be one of many great books you must
have will be giving you more than just simple reading food but feed a person with information that possibly
will shock your before knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Survival of North Korea: Essays
on Strategy, Economics and International Relations forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as
rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day task. So , let's have
it and enjoy reading.

Terry Kiser:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time little but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books



in the top listing in your reading list will be The Survival of North Korea: Essays on Strategy, Economics
and International Relations. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing
to be precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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