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Coming from conversations with executive teams of technology companies, venture capitalists, and M&A
advisers, the insights contained in Why Killer Products Don't Sell are gold dust. First the book lays bare the
claim that sales is sales is sales. It exposes the 4 very different 'Buying Cultures' and how they should be
approached: Value Offered, Value Added, Value Created, and Value Captured. But it also gives a proven
methodology for assessing a company's product mix ('offering' vs 'buying culture'), and a transformation
approach to optimize sales and improve competitiveness.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Jones:

This Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company to a New Set of Rules book is not ordinary
book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. This Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your
Company to a New Set of Rules without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in
pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company
to a New Set of Rules can bring once you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' grow to be full
because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How
to Run Your Company to a New Set of Rules having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not
truly feel uninterested in reading.

Rebecca Lopez:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than can
satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-book that
need more time to be learn. Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company to a New Set of
Rules can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone who have those short time problems.

Sylvia Kirby:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but novel and Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company
to a New Set of Rules or others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the good a book,
you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher as well as students
especially. Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In different case, beside science book, any
other book likes Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company to a New Set of Rules to make
your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Lena Stubbs:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As we
know those books have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the
world. From the book Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company to a New Set of Rules we
can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To be creative person must like to read
a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this



book Why Killer Products Don't Sell: How to Run Your Company to a New Set of Rules. You can more
appealing than now.
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