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The book aims to prioritise what needs mastering and presents the content in the most understandable,
concise and pedagogical way illustrated by real market examples. Given the variety and the complexity of
the materials the book covers, the author sorts through a vast array of topics in a subjective way, relying
upon more than twenty years of experience as a market practitioner. The book only requires the reader to be
knowledgeable in the basics of algebra and statistics.

The Mathematical formulae are only fully proven when the proof brings some useful insight. These formulae
are translated from algebra into plain English to aid understanding as the vast majority of practitioners
involved in the financial markets are not required to compute or calculate prices or sensitivities themselves
as they have access to data providers. Thus, the intention of this book is for the practitioner to gain a deeper
understanding of these calculations, both for a safety reason – it is better to understand what is behind the
data we manipulate – and secondly being able to appreciate the magnitude of the prices we are confronted
with and being able to draft a rough calculation, aside of the market data.

The author has avoided excessive formalism where possible. Formalism is securing the outputs of research,
but may, in other circumstances, burden the understanding by non-mathematicians; an example of this case is
in the chapter dedicated to the basis of stochastic calculus.

The book is divided into two parts:

First, the deterministic world, starting from the yield curve building and related calculations (spot rates,●

forward rates, discrete versus continuous compounding, etc.), and continuing with spot instruments
valuation (short term rates, bonds, currencies and stocks) and forward instruments valuation (forward
forex, FRAs and variants, swaps & futures);

Second, the probabilistic world, starting with the basis of stochastic calculus and the alternative approach●

of ARMA to GARCH, and continuing with derivative pricing: options, second generation options,
volatility, credit derivatives;

This second part is completed by a chapter dedicated to market performance & risk measures, and a chapter●

widening the scope of quantitative models beyond the Gaussian hypothesis and evidencing the potential
troubles linked to derivative pricing models.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Graves:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Mathematics of the Financial Markets: Financial Instruments and
Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk Issues book is readable by means of you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving
also decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer connected with Mathematics of the
Financial Markets: Financial Instruments and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk Issues content
conveys objective easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
written content but it just different by means of it. So , do you even now thinking Mathematics of the
Financial Markets: Financial Instruments and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk Issues is not
loveable to be your top list reading book?

Gene Kistler:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want experience
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The actual Mathematics of the Financial
Markets: Financial Instruments and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk Issues is kind of guide which
is giving the reader unstable experience.

Richard Daniels:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is
this Mathematics of the Financial Markets: Financial Instruments and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and
Risk Issues.

Harold Thompson:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in
e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Mathematics of the Financial Markets: Financial Instruments
and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk Issues can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at



this one book you have factor that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. That book can be
one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be your friend doesn't learn,
by knowing more than some other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have
Mathematics of the Financial Markets: Financial Instruments and Derivatives Modelling, Valuation and Risk
Issues.
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