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Twilight of the Idols was written in just over a week, between 26 August and 3 September 1888, while
Nietzsche was on holiday in Sils Maria. As Nietzsche's fame and popularity was spreading both inside and
outside Germany, he felt that he needed a text that would serve as a short introduction to his work. Originally
titled A Psychologist's Idleness, it was renamed Twilight of the Idols or How to Philosophize with a
Hammer.
The former title, Götzen-Dämmerung in German, is a pun on the title of Richard Wagner's opera,
Götterdämmerung, or 'Twilight of the Gods'. Götze is a German word for "idol" or "false god". Walter
Kaufmann has suggested that in his use of the word Nietzsche might be indebted to Francis Bacon.
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From reader reviews:

Corrine Switzer:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Twilight of the Idols. All type of
book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Enrique Hayes:

Often the book Twilight of the Idols has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can
get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes some research
previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this book.

Amanda Acuna:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get wide
range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare
time, often the book you have read will be Twilight of the Idols.

Virginia Berry:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more
time to be study. Twilight of the Idols can be your answer because it can be read by you who have those
short time problems.
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