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"I knew the angel that just walked in the door was the one for me."

Beatrice Holt seems to have it all. She's got a passionate and loving marriage to the perfect man, billionaire
Jeremy Holt, and all the opportunities and financial security that comes with it. However, life wasn't always
so wonderful. When a tragic accident results in amnesia, she is effectively transported back to a time when
all her emotional wounds are still causing her intense pain. She can't remember how those wounds were
healed the first time around, she can't remember her marriage, she can't remember the man behind the money
at all. All she sees in Jeremy is the very kind of man she swore she would never fall for.

Can Jeremy find a way to make her fall in love with him all over again and make lightning strike twice? Will
Beatrice remember their song or has their one chance for happiness slipped through their fingers?

From USA Today Best Selling Author Emma South comes a billionaire romance with real heart!
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From reader reviews:

Sybil Davis:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this Remember Our Song: A Billionaire
Romance (OUR SONG SERIES Book 3) book as beginner and daily reading reserve. Why, because this
book is usually more than just a book.

Gregory Polster:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a e-book. The book Remember Our Song: A Billionaire Romance (OUR SONG SERIES
Book 3) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not
very costly but this book has high quality.

Kimberly Dyer:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time,
the particular book you have read is usually Remember Our Song: A Billionaire Romance (OUR SONG
SERIES Book 3).

Edward Doucet:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just in search of the Remember Our Song: A Billionaire Romance (OUR SONG SERIES Book 3) when you



needed it?
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